Bid Tabulation

11-40

Chemicals for the City of Aurora Water Treatement Plant
Bid Opening October 26, 2011

Calclium FIuortfsiIicic Powjered Catiinic Sodsium
Company Name Oxide Acid Activated Polymer Hypo-
(Lime) Carbon chlorite
Alexander Chemical Corp. Year 1 0.3468 0.89
Year 2 no bid no bid
BASF Corporation Year 1 0.45
Year 2 0.47
Calgon Carbon Year 1 0.61
Year 2 0.64
Carmeuse Lime Year 1 180.28
Year 2 189.28
Epco Carbon Dioxide Products Year1
Year 2
K A Steel Chemicals, Inc. Year 1 0.618
Year 2 no bid
Lhoist North America Year 1 215.00
Year 2 no bid
Mays Chemical Co. Year 1 0.73
Year 2 0.73
MeadWestvaco Year 1 0.59
Year 2 no bid
Mississippi Lime Year 1 142.60
Year 2 no bid
Norit Americas Year 1 0.68
Year 2 0.65
Polydyne, Inc. Year 1 0.365
Year 2 0.375
Pencco, Inc. Year 1 0.3365
Year 2 no bid
Rowell Chemical Corp. Year 1 0.749
Year 2 0.749
Standard Purification Year 1 0.5325
Year 2 0.5325
Thatcher Company Year 1 0.564
Year 2 no bid
Vertex Chemical Corporation  Year 1 0.77
Year 2 0.90
Western Lime Year 1 147.88
Year 2 154.36




