CHEMICAL BID TABULATION 2011 1 2 3 4 5 6
_ L Sodium A .
Company Name Anhydrogs Fluoro§|I|C|c C.arb.on Cationic Hypo- Liquid Eernc
Ammonia Acid Dixoide Polymer Chlorite Chloride
Alexander Chemical Corp. Year 1 0.3625 0.77
Year 2 no bid no bid
Airgas Specialty Products Year 1 No Bid
Year 2 No Bid
BASF Corporation Year 1 0.35
Year 2 0.40
Continental Carbonic Year 1 0.0420
Year 2 0.0435
Epco Carbon Dioxide Products Year 1 0.030
Year 2 0.031
K A Steel Chemicals, Inc. Year 1 0.515
Year 2 0.515
Kemira Water Solutions Year 1 no bid no bid 0.098
Year 2 no bid no bid 0.098
Lucier Chemical Industries, Inc. no bid
Nalco Company Year 1 no bid
Year 2 no bid
Polydyne, Inc. Year 1 0.29
Year 2 0.30
Pencco, Inc. no bid
Praxair no bid
PVS Technologies Year 1 0.108
Year 2 0.112
Rowell Chemical Corp. Year 1 0.6597
Year 2 0.6597
Solvay Fluorides LLC no bid
Tanner Industries Year 1 0.63
Year 2 0.65
Vertex Chemical Corporation Year 1 0.90
Year 2 1.00




