CITY OF AURORA

BID TABULATIONS FORM 10-07
CITYWIDE ASPHALT PURCHASE PROGRAM
FOR THE CITY OF AURORA

Aurora Blacktop, Superior Pyramid
Builders Asphalt, Inc. Asphalt Prime, Inc.
ITEM LLC. 1065 Sard Ave. Materials PO Box 998
NO DESCRIPTION UNIT 45W?295 Main St. Montgomery, IL PO Box 998 Aurora, IL
' Elburn, IL 60119 60538 Aurora, IL 60507
630-557-0090 630-892-9389 60507 630-892-4357
630-892-4357
1 Hot-Mix Asphalt Surface Course Ton $59.00 $55.00 $58.50 No Bid
' Mix “C”, N50
5 Hot-Mix Asphalt Binder Course Ton $53.00 $44.00 $54.50 No Bid
' IL-19.0, N50
3 Hot-Mix Asphalt Surface Course Ton $59.00 $55.00 $58.50 No Bid
' Mix “D”, N50
4 Hot-Mix Asphalt Surface Course Ton $61.00 $55.00 $59.75 No Bid
' Mix “D”, N70
Cold Mix (Rte. 25 and Indian No Bid $85.00 $72.00 No Bid
5. . Ton
Trail)
Sylvax UPM (Rte. 25 and Indian $95.00 plus a N/A $109.50 No Bid
6. Trail) Ton | onetime $30.00
loading fee
7 Prime ( 5 gallon pails) 5 $45.00 $65.00 $60.00 No Bid

gallon




CITY OF AURORA
BID TABULATIONS FORM 10-07
CITYWIDE ASPHALT PURCHASE PROGRAM
FOR THE CITY OF AURORA

Builders Asphalt, Aurora Blacktop. Superior Asphalt Pyramid Prime,
LLC. 1065 Sard Ave. Materials Inc.
45W295 Main St. Montgomery, IL PO Box 998 PO Box 998
DUMP FEES Elburn, IL 60119 60538 Aurora, IL 60507 | Aurora, IL 60507
630-557-0090 630-892-9389 630-892-4357 630-892-4357

Clean and broken asphalt

SEMI $100.00 N/A $100.00 No Bid

6-WHEEL $75.00 N/A $75.00 No Bid

4-WHEEL $50.00 N/A $50.00 No Bid

Clean and broken asphalt

With asphalt purchase

SEMI N/C N/A $75.00 No Bid

6-WHEEL N/C N/A $50.00 No Bid

4-WHEEL N/C N/A $25.00 No Bid

Clean and broken concrete

SEMI No Bid N/A N/C No Bid

6-WHEEL No Bid N/A N/C No Bid

A-\WHEEL No Bid N/A N/C No Bid




CITY OF AURORA
BID TABULATIONS FORM 10-07
CITYWIDE ASPHALT PURCHASE PROGRAM

FOR THE CITY OF AURORA

Contractor Spraying-
Prime Oil

Builders Asphalt,
LLC.
45W295 Main St.
Elburn, IL 60119

Aurora Blacktop,
Inc.
1065 Sard Ave.
Montgomery, IL

Superior Asphalt
Materials
PO Box 998
Aurora, IL 60507

Pyramid Prime,
Inc.
PO Box 998
Aurora, IL 60507
630-892-4357

60538
630-557-0090 630-892-9389 630-892-4357
Minimum of gallons No Bid 100 No Bid ok
No Bid $2.50 No Bid ke

Price per gallon

*** Please see attached chart.




