
Cost per Mowing Cycle for 2011

Bid as Read 697.00$     * 1,100.00$  
1           

11,970.00$  
2           

90,080.00$  1,495.00$  
3           

32,175.00$  

Bid as Calculated 697.00$     2,092.00$  1,740.00$    2,815.00$    1,495.00$  32,175.00$  

Cost Addition per Square Yard:

0-500 0.0200$     0.0210$     0.1000$       0.0300$       0.2500$     0.0080$       

Sample: Cost for 500 sq yds 10.00$       10.50$       50.00$         15.00$         125.00$     4.00$           

501-1500 0.0200$     0.0185$     0.0300$       0.0300$       0.1500$     0.0080$       

1501-2500 0.0200$     0.0179$     0.0200$       0.0300$       0.0700$     0.0080$       

2501-6500 0.0200$     0.0175$     0.0200$       0.0300$       0.0400$     0.0080$       

6501+ 0.0100$     0.0170$     0.0200$       0.0300$       0.0300$     0.0080$       

Cost per Mowing Cycle for 2012

Bid as Read 697.00$     * 1,100.00$  
1           

11,970.00$  
2           

90,080.00$  1,495.00$  
3           

32,175.00$  

Bid as Calculated 697.00$     2,092.00$  1,740.00$    2,815.00$    1,495.00$  32,175.00$  

Cost Addition per Square Yard:

0-500 0.0200$     0.0210$     0.1000$       0.0300$       0.2500$     0.0080$       

Sample: Cost for 500 sq yrds 10.00$       10.50$       50.00$         15.00$         125.00$     4.00$           

501-1500 0.0200$     0.0185$     0.0300$       0.0300$       0.1500$     0.0080$       

1501-2500 0.0200$     0.0179$     0.0200$       0.0300$       0.0700$     0.0080$       

2501-6500 0.0200$     0.0175$     0.0200$       0.0300$       0.0400$     0.0080$       

6501+ 0.0100$     0.0170$     0.0200$       0.0300$       0.0300$     0.0080$       

* Volume discount offered

1 Annual amount written on bid form, calculated amount is per mowing cycle

2 Annual amount written on bid form, calculated amount is per mowing cycle

3 Annual amount written and calculated

The City of Aurora reserves the right to reject any or all bids, to waive any technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids received.  The City further reserves the

right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds in quality, fitness and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage

and therefore is in the best interest of the City.

Bid Tabulation for 11-07

Landscape Maintenance for Parks and Recreation

Opened March 9, 2011

CITY OF AURORA

Alaniz Group, Inc

Elgin, IL  60120 

American Tree

& Turf

Sugar Grove, IL  

60554

Carefree Lawn

Maintenance

Lockport, IL  60441

R.Riley Lawn and

Snow Service

Aurora, IL  60506

Tri County 

Excavation

& Construction

Aurora, IL  60505

Twin Oaks 

Landscaping, Inc.

Oswego, IL  60543



American Tree & 

Turf

Sugar Grove, IL

60554

Carefree Lawn 

Maintenance, Inc. 

Lockport, IL 60441

Classic Landscape 

LTD

West Chicago, IL 

60185

Clauss Brothers, Inc.

Steamwood, IL 60107

R. Riley Lawn and 

Snow Service

Aurora, IL 60506

Semper Fi Yard 

Service, Inc.

Aurora, IL  60506

Tri-County 

Excavation & 

Construction

Aurora, IL  60505

Twin Oaks 

Landscaping, Inc.

Oswego, IL  

60543

Cost per Mowing Cycle for 2011

Months of April 3,864.00$          2,000.00$              4,500.00$           2,500.00$                  5,150.00$            2,394.00$            6,037.20$              2,725.00$            

Months of May through October 3,864.00$          4,166.67$              5,200.00$           2,500.00$                  3,575.00$            3,900.00$            6,037.20$              2,725.00$            

Month of November 3,400.00$          1,000.00$              3,900.00$           2,500.00$                  5,150.00              1,860.00$            3,622.32$              2,725.00$            

Cost per Mowing Cycle for 2012

Months of April 3,864.00$          2,000.00$              4,500.00$           2,550.00$                  5,150.00$            2,394.00$            3,622.32$              2,725.00$            

Months of May through October 3,864.00$          4,166.67$              5,200.00$           2,550.00$                  3,575.00$            3,900.00$            6,037.20$              2,725.00$            

Month of November 3,400.00$          1,000.00$              3,900.00$           2,550.00$                  5,150.00$            1,860.00$            3,622.32$              2,725.00$            

The City of Aurora reserves the right to reject any or all bids, to waive any technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids received.  The City further reserves the

right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds in quality, fitness and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage

and therefore is in the best interest of the City.

Bid Tabulation for 11-07

Landscape Maintenance for Rt 25 & Rt 59 Commuter Stations

Opened March 9, 2011

CITY OF AURORA



East Side Landscape Maintenance

Cost per Mowing Cycle for 2011

Bid as Read 1,063.00$    
1            

4,332.00$    
2            

30,443.35$    3,210.00$      No bid No bid 6,730.00$    
3            

46,546.27$    

Bid as Calculated 1,063.00$    4,365.86$    4,349.05$      3,210.00$      6,750.00$    46,546.27$    

Cost Addition per Square Yard:

0-500 0.0200$       0.0235$       0.1000$         0.0200$         -$               -$               0.2500$       0.0080$         

Sample: Cost for 500 sq yds 10.00$         11.75$         50.00$           10.00$           -$               -$               125.00$       4.00$             

501-1500 0.0200$       0.0230$       0.0300$         0.0200$         -$               -$               0.1500$       0.0080$         

1501-2500 0.0200$       0.0225$       0.0200$         0.0100$         -$               -$               0.0700$       0.0080$         

2501-6500 0.0200$       0.0219$       0.0200$         0.0080$         -$               -$               0.0400$       0.0080$         

6501+ 0.0100$       0.0215$       0.0200$         0.0080$         -$               -$               0.0300$       0.0080$         

Cost per Mowing Cycle for 2012

Bid as Read 1,063.00$    * 4,332.00$    
1            

30,443.35$    3,210.00$      No bid No bid 6,730.00$    
3            

46,546.27$    

Bid as Calculated 1,063.00$    4,365.86$    4,349.05$      3,210.00$      6,750.00$    46,546.27$    

Cost Addition per Square Yard:

0-500 0.0200$       0.0235$       0.1000$         0.0200$         -$               -$               0.2500$       0.0080$         

Sample: Cost for 500 sq yrds 10.00$         11.75$         50.00$           10.00$           -$               -$               125.00$       4.00$             

501-1500 0.0200$       0.0230$       0.0300$         0.0200$         -$               -$               0.1500$       0.0080$         

1501-2500 0.0200$       0.0225$       0.0200$         0.0100$         -$               -$               0.0700$       0.0080$         

2501-6500 0.0200$       0.0219$       0.0200$         0.0080$         -$               -$               0.0400$       0.0080$         

6501+ 0.0100$       0.0215$       0.0200$         0.0080$         -$               -$               0.0300$       0.0080$         

West Side Landscape Maintenance

Cost per Mowing Cycle for 2011

Bid as Read 706.00$       
1            

1,000.00$    
2            

16,787.33$    1,505.00$      No bid 2,240.00$      3,595.00$    
3            

29,063.69$    

Bid as Calculated 706.00$       1,819.15$    2,398.19$      1,505.00$      2,240.00$      3,575.00$    29,063.69$    

Cost Addition per Square Yard:

Bid Tabulation for 11-07

Landscape Maintenance for Street Division

Opened March 9, 2011

CITY OF AURORA

Alaniz Group, Inc

Elgin, IL  60120 

American Tree

& Turf

Sugar Grove, IL  

60554

Carefree Lawn

Maintenance

Lockport, IL  60441

Classic Landscape, 

LTD

West Chicago, IL 

60185

Tri County 

Excavation

& Construction

Aurora, IL  60505

Twin Oaks 

Landscaping, Inc.

Oswego, IL  60543

East Side, West Side and SSA #14

Semper Fi Yard 

Service Inc.

Aurora, IL  60506

R.Riley Lawn and 

Snow Service

Aurora, IL 60506
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0-500 0.0200$       0.0201$       0.1000$         0.0200$         -$               0.0500$         0.2500$       0.0080$         

Sample: Cost for 500 sq yds 10.00$         10.05$         50.00$           10.00$           -$               25.00$           125.00$       4.00$             

501-1500 0.0200$       0.0185$       0.0300$         0.0200$         -$               0.0280$         0.1500$       0.0080$         

1501-2500 0.0200$       0.0180$       0.0200$         0.0100$         -$               0.0150$         0.0700$       0.0080$         

2501-6500 0.0200$       0.0177$       0.0200$         0.0080$         -$               0.0140$         0.0400$       0.0080$         

6501+ 0.0100$       0.0175$       0.0200$         0.0080$         -$               0.0130$         0.0300$       0.0080$         

Cost per Mowing Cycle for 2012

Bid as Read 706.00$       
1            

1,000.00$    
1            

16,787.33$    1,505.00$      No bid 2,240.00$      3,595.00$    
3            

29,063.69$    

Bid as Calculated 706.00$       1,819.15$    2,398.19$      1,505.00$      2,240.00$      3,575.00$    29,063.69$    

Cost Addition per Square Yard:

0-500 0.0200$       0.0201$       0.1000$         0.0200$         -$               0.0500$         0.2500$       0.0080$         

Sample: Cost for 500 sq yrds 10.00$         10.05$         50.00$           10.00$           -$               25.00$           125.00$       4.00$             

501-1500 0.0200$       0.0185$       0.0300$         0.0200$         -$               0.0280$         0.1500$       0.0080$         

1501-2500 0.0200$       0.0180$       0.0200$         0.0100$         -$               0.0150$         0.0700$       0.0080$         

2501-6500 0.0200$       0.0177$       0.0200$         0.0080$         -$               0.0140$         0.0400$       0.0080$         

6501+ 0.0100$       0.0175$       0.0200$         0.0080$         -$               0.0130$         0.0300$       0.0080$         

SSA #14 Landscape Maintenance

Cost per Mowing Cycle for 2011

Months of April No bid 800.00$       2,077.60$      3,200.00$      1,350.00$      990.00$         1,973.70$    925.00$         

Months of May through October 800.00$       4,328.33$      1,800.00$      1,950.00$      1,133.50$      1,973.70$    925.00$         

Month of November 800.00$       1,038.80$      2,100.00$      1,350.00$      1,080.00$      1,184.22$    925.00$         

Cost per Mowing Cycle for 2012

Months of April No bid 800.00$       2,077.60$      3,200.00$      1,350.00$      990.00$         1,973.70$    925.00$         

Months of May through October 800.00$       4,328.33$      1,800.00$      1,950.00$      1,133.50$      1,973.70$    925.00$         

Month of November 800.00$       1,038.80$      2,100.00$      1,350.00$      1,080.00$      1,184.22$    925.00$         

1 Volume discount offered

2 Annual amount written on bid form, calculated amount is per mowing cycle

3 Annual amount written and calculated

The City of Aurora reserves the right to reject any or all bids, to waive any technicality, informality or irregularity in the bids received.  The City further reserves the

right to award the bid to the lowest responsible bidder whose offer best responds in quality, fitness and capacity to the requirements of the proposed work or usage

and therefore is in the best interest of the City.
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