

Bid Tabulation  
12-55  
Chemicals for the City of Aurora Water Treatment Plant  
Bid Opening October 24, 2012

		1	2	3	4	5	6
Company Name		Fluorosilicic Acid	Liquid Ferric Chloride	Calcium Oxide	Carbon Dioxide	Sodium Hypochlorite	Anhydrous Ammonia
Airgas Specialty Products	Year 1						No Bid
Airgas Specialty Products	Year 2						No Bid
Alexander Chemical Corporation	Year 1	0.3375				0.89	
Alexander Chemical Corporation	Year 2	No Bid				No Bid	
Carmeuse Lime & Stone	Year 1			173.42			
Carmeuse Lime & Stone	Year 2			182.09			
Continental Carbonic Products, Inc.	Year 1				0.038		
Continental Carbonic Products, Inc.	Year 2				0.039		
Graymont Western Lime, Inc.	Year 1			156.00			
Graymont Western Lime, Inc.	Year 2			164.00			
K A Steel Chemicals, Inc.	Year 1					0.613	
K A Steel Chemicals, Inc.	Year 2					0.613	
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.	Year 1		0.094				
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.	Year 2		0.094				
Lhoist North America of Missouri, Inc.	Year 1			229.30			
Lhoist North America of Missouri, Inc.	Year 2			No Bid			
Mississippi Lime Company	Year 1			385.00			
Mississippi Lime Company	Year 2			No Bid			
Pencco, Inc.	Year 1	0.3345					
Pencco, Inc.	Year 2	No Bid					
PVS Technologies, Inc.	Year 1		0.095				
PVS Technologies, Inc.	Year 2		0.095				
Rowell Chemical Corp	Year 1					0.745	
Rowell Chemical Corp	Year 2					0.745	
Tanner Industries, Inc.	Year 1						0.067
Tanner Industries, Inc.	Year 2						0.705
Vertex Chemical Corporation	Year 1					0.73	
Vertex Chemical Corporation	Year 2					0.90	