

Bid Tabulation
13-52
Chemicals for the City of Aurora Water Treatment Plant
Bid Opening October 23, 2013

		1	2	3	4	5
Company Name		Fluorosilicic Acid	Powdered Activated Carbon	Cationic Polymer	Sodium Hypo-chlorite	Calcium Oxide (QuickLime)
Alexander Chemical Corporation	Year 1	0.2945			0.749	
Alexander Chemical Corporation	Year 2	No Bid			No Bid	
BASF Corporation	Year 1			0.28		
BASF Corporation	Year 2			0.29		
Calgon Carbon Corporation	Year 1		0.68			
Calgon Carbon Corporation	Year 2		0.71			
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc.	Year 1					184.10
Carmeuse Lime & Stone, Inc.	Year 2					189.61
Chemrite, Inc.	Year 1					154.70
Chemrite, Inc.	Year 2					164.00
General Chemical Performance Products	Year 1	No Bid				
General Chemical Performance Products	Year 2	No Bid				
GEO Specialty Chemicals	Year 1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
GEO Specialty Chemicals	Year 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Graymont Western Lime Inc.	Year 1					164.00
Graymont Western Lime Inc.	Year 2					169.00
KA Steel Chemicals, Inc.	Year 1				0.632	
KA Steel Chemicals, Inc.	Year 2				No Bid	
Key Chemical, Inc.	Year 1	0.3295				
Key Chemical, Inc.	Year 2	0.3285				
Lhoist North America of Missouri, Inc.	Year 1					232.45
Lhoist North America of Missouri, Inc.	Year 2					No Bid
Mississippi Lime Company	Year 1					166.25
Mississippi Lime Company	Year 2					166.25
Mosaic Crop Nutrition, LLC	Year 1	0.266				
Mosaic Crop Nutrition, LLC	Year 2	0.266				
Nalco Company	Year 1			0.53		
Nalco Company	Year 2			0.58		
Pencco, Inc.	Year 1	0.3488				
Pencco, Inc.	Year 2	0.3617				
Polydyne Inc	Year 1			0.333		
Polydyne Inc	Year 2			0.333		
Rowell Chemical Corporation	Year 1				0.6374	
Rowell Chemical Corporation	Year 2				No Bid	
Solvay Fluorrides, LLC	Year 1	No Bid				
Solvay Fluorrides, LLC	Year 2	No Bid				
Standard Purification	Year 1		0.559			
Standard Purification	Year 2		0.569			
Vertex Chemical Corporation	Year 1				0.73	
Vertex Chemical Corporation	Year 2				0.90	