

City of Aurora Request for Quotations 13-60  
2014 Materials and Supplies for Water and Sewer Maintenance Department  
Bid Tabulation

Line Item	Description	Supplier Quotations					
		Ferguson Waterworks Dekalb, IL	JSN Contractors Supply Naperville, IL	Mid American Water, Inc. Aurora, IL	Municipal Marking Distributors Gillberts, IL	Water Products Company Aurora, IL	Ziebell Water Service Products, Inc. Elk Grove Village, IL
<b>HYDRANTS (WATEROUS)</b>							
1	5' WB-67 (W/ACC)	No Bid	No Bid	1,977.00	No Bid	2,005.00	2,035.00
2	5'6" WB-67 (W/ACC)	No Bid	No Bid	2,028.00	No Bid	2,049.00	2,080.00
3	6' WB-67 (W/ACC)	No Bid	No Bid	2,073.00	No Bid	2,094.00	2,150.00
4	4 1/2' WB-67 (W/ACC)	No Bid	No Bid	1,942.00	No Bid	1,961.00	1,990.00
<b>EXTENSIONS (WATEROUS ONLY)</b>							
5	6" WB-67	No Bid	No Bid	309.50	No Bid	329.00	330.00
6	12" WB-67	No Bid	No Bid	363.50	No Bid	387.00	385.00
7	18" WB-67	No Bid	No Bid	421.50	No Bid	450.00	445.00
8	24" WB-67	No Bid	No Bid	474.50	No Bid	510.00	495.00
<b>WB-67 TRAFFIC KITS (WATEROUS ONLY)</b>							
9	OLD STYLE (K525/10")	No Bid	No Bid	174.50	No Bid	209.00	215.00
10	NEW STYLE (K528/10")	No Bid	No Bid	144.50	No Bid	170.00	185.00
<b>MJ CUTTING IN VALVES (WITH ACC) FLOW RESILIENT WEDGE</b>							
11	2"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	685.00	No Bid
13	6"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	940.00	No Bid
14	8"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1,455.00	No Bid
15	10"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2,150.00	No Bid
16	12"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2,715.00	No Bid
<b>MJ REGULAR VALVES (WITH ACC) AMERICAN FLOW CONTROL RESILIENT WEDGE</b>							
17	2"	No Bid	No Bid	295.50	No Bid	No Bid	350.00
18	4"	No Bid	No Bid	440.00	No Bid	459.00	465.00
19	6"	556.00	No Bid	557.00	No Bid	585.00	599.00

20	8"	874.00	No Bid	878.00	No Bid	914.00	975.00	
21	10"	No Bid	No Bid	1,375.00	No Bid	1,419.00	1,485.00	
22	12"	No Bid	No Bid	1,728.00	No Bid	1,784.00	1,840.00	
23	14"	No Bid	No Bid	5,400.00	No Bid	5,750.00	5,700.00	
24	16"	No Bid	No Bid	5,795.00	No Bid	5,880.00	6,250.00	
<b>CUTTING IN SLEEVES (W/ACC) (TYLER ONLY)</b>								
25	4"	361.03	No Bid	349.00	No Bid	362.00	375.00	
26	6"	481.14	No Bid	464.00	No Bid	480.00	505.00	
27	8"	623.15	No Bid	600.00	No Bid	622.00	640.00	
28	10"	764.00	No Bid	737.00	No Bid	768.00	775.00	
29	12"	1,018.00	No Bid	982.00	No Bid	1,020.00	1,130.00	
30	<b>664-S VALVE BOX COMPLETE W/LID (TYLER ONLY)</b>	140.00	No Bid	148.50	No Bid	152.00	175.00	
<b>VALVE BOX EXTENSIONS (TYLER ONLY)</b>								
31	#58	42.00	No Bid	42.00	No Bid	43.00	52.00	
32	#59	50.00	No Bid	51.00	No Bid	52.00	63.00	
33	#69	44.00	No Bid	45.00	No Bid	53.00	61.00	
34	#69A – 9"	42.00	No Bid	43.00	No Bid	43.00	60.00	
35	#69A – 18" (Foreign okay)	25.50	No Bid	44.00	No Bid	28.00	41.00	
36	#69A – 24" (Foreign okay)	33.00	No Bid	48.00	No Bid	33.00	46.00	
<b>CAST COUPLINGS</b>								
37	2"	24.44	No Bid	44.00	No Bid	53.00	35.00	
38	4"	51.50	No Bid	85.00	No Bid	90.00	68.00	
39	6" All 6" & above quote the	64.50	No Bid	130.00	No Bid	131.00	91.00	
40	8" the following brands:	82.50	No Bid	160.00	No Bid	162.00	115.00	
41	12" Mid America - power steel	140.00	No Bid	240.00	No Bid	247.00	165.00	
42	14" US Filter - smith/blair	234.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	298.00	
43	16" Water Products - cascade	310.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	385.00	
<b>WB-67 HYDRANT PARTS (WATEROUS ONLY)</b>								
44	K834 Complete w/top assembly	No Bid	No Bid	1,820.00	No Bid	1,710.00	1,850.00	
45	K836	No Bid	No Bid	995.00	No Bid	925.00	1,050.00	
46	Ref. #60 Casting (Hydrant Head)	No Bid	No Bid	402.00	No Bid	379.00	415.00	
47	<b>3/4" FLARED CORP (FORD-MCDONALD-MUELLER)</b>	No Lead 21.84	No Bid	No Lead 31.50	No Bid	No Lead 21.62	Lead 23.75	No Lead 31.50
48	<b>1" FLARED CORP (FORD-MCDONALD-MUELLER)</b>	33.38	No Bid	38.70	No Bid	33.03	41.95	49.50

49	<b>1-1/2" FLARED CORP</b>	98.47	No Bid	101.40	No Bid	101.32	95.00	116.95
50	<b>2" FLARED CORP</b>	176.00	No Bid	177.20	No Bid	176.99	190.00	247.75
<b>CURB STOP-FULL PORT (Curb stop – Full port FLARED) (FORD-MCDONALD-MUELLER)</b>								
51	3/4"	52.00	No Bid	52.05	No Bid	52.00	54.00	58.50
52	1"	70.00	No Bid	70.25	No Bid	70.18	81.00	87.15
53	1-1/2"	166.00	No Bid	165.00	No Bid	164.91	165.00	206.50
54	2"	269.00	No Bid	267.00	No Bid	266.79	270.00	334.50
<b>CURB BOXES – No Foreign Boxes</b>								
55	1-1/4" (5-6 FEET BURY)	28.30	No Bid	35.50	No Bid	28.95	37.95	
56	1-1/2" (5-6 FEET BURY)	41.75	No Bid	46.00	No Bid	42.40	49.95	
<b>MJ ACCESSORY KIT</b>								
57	SDR 21 - 2"	14.30	No Bid	15.00	No Bid	No Bid	23.00	
58	4"	17.50	No Bid	18.00	No Bid	18.00	19.50	
59	6"	22.00	No Bid	22.00	No Bid	22.00	24.25	
60	8"	24.50	No Bid	24.00	No Bid	25.00	29.95	
61	10"	35.00	No Bid	35.00	No Bid	35.00	38.75	
62	12"	38.50	No Bid	38.00	No Bid	38.00	43.50	
<b>DR-18 C-900 PVC PIPE 20'</b>								
63	4"	47.00	No Bid	47.50	No Bid	46.00	63.00	
64	6"	93.00	No Bid	94.00	No Bid	91.00	125.00	
65	8"	162.00	No Bid	165.00	No Bid	157.80	220.00	
66	10"	243.00	No Bid	245.00	No Bid	236.20	330.00	
67	12"	343.00	No Bid	346.00	No Bid	333.60	450.00	
68	16"	660.00	No Bid	537.60	No Bid	618.00	825.00	
69	18"	890.00	No Bid	770.00	No Bid	775.20	1,050.00	
<b>SDR-26 PVC PIPE 14'</b>								
70	4"	18.00	No Bid	24.00	No Bid	17.78	24.00	
71	6"	38.00	No Bid	49.00	No Bid	37.94	45.00	
72	8"	69.00	No Bid	97.00	No Bid	68.46	75.00	
73	10"	110.00	No Bid	140.00	No Bid	107.10	130.00	
74	12"	162.00	No Bid	200.00	No Bid	152.46	190.00	
75	15"	240.00	No Bid	310.00	No Bid	231.84	280.00	
76	18"	370.00	No Bid	329.28	No Bid	350.00	535.00	
<b>CLASS 52 DUCTILE IRON PIPE (PUSH JOINT)</b>								
77	6" PER FOOT	18.00	No Bid	22.61	No Bid	17.22	23.00	

78	8" " "	25.00	No Bid	30.91	No Bid	23.95	32.00
79	10" " "	36.00	No Bid	42.32	No Bid	31.72	43.00
80	12" " "	49.00	No Bid	50.90	No Bid	39.55	55.00
81	16" " "	75.00	No Bid	73.81	No Bid	57.15	81.00
<b>MISSION COUPLING (CLAY TO PLASTIC) (NON SHEAR)</b>							
82	4"	14.86	No Bid	14.00	No Bid	25.35	23.00
83	6"	22.99	No Bid	27.50	No Bid	43.00	54.00
84	8"	31.21	No Bid	39.00	No Bid	48.00	64.00
85	10"	43.30	No Bid	58.00	No Bid	63.50	84.00
86	12"	52.88	No Bid	68.00	No Bid	77.50	104.00
87	15"	84.03	No Bid	95.00	No Bid	147.00	180.00
<b>MISSION COUPLING (PLASTIC TO PLASTIC) (NON SHEAR)</b>							
88	4"	15.12	No Bid	16.00	No Bid	17.00	21.00
89	6"	22.35	No Bid	23.00	No Bid	32.95	49.00
90	8"	29.31	No Bid	24.50	No Bid	48.95	60.00
91	10"	44.95	No Bid	49.50	No Bid	63.50	79.00
92	12"	51.18	No Bid	58.00	No Bid	77.50	92.00
93	15"	105.81	No Bid	85.00	No Bid	133.00	170.00
<b>REPAIR CLAMPS</b>							
94	2" X 8"	31.00	No Bid	32.60	No Bid	41.00	45.75
95	4" X 8"	40.30	No Bid	42.25	No Bid	49.00	57.00
96	6" X 10"	59.00	No Bid	62.10	No Bid	82.00	87.00
97	8" X 8"	51.50	No Bid	72.25	No Bid	71.00	75.60
98	10" X 10"	89.50	No Bid	91.50	No Bid	121.00	129.25
99	12" X 12"	120.00	No Bid	119.50	No Bid	170.00	186.75
100	6" X 8"	46.00	No Bid	48.25	No Bid	61.00	64.70
101	8" X 10"	65.50	No Bid	67.50	No Bid	94.00	99.50
102	10" X 12"	104.00	No Bid	103.00	No Bid	145.00	154.15
103	12" X 16"	136.00	No Bid	135.00	No Bid	190.00	212.50
<b>MARKING PAINT/INVERTED TIP 13 OZ. CANS ENVIRONMENTAL SAFE</b>							
104	BLUE PAINT/CAN	2.06	2.15	6.50	2.70	3.50	4.20
105	GREEN PAINT/CAN	2.06	2.15	6.50	2.70	3.50	4.20
106	WHITE PAINT/CAN	2.06	2.15	6.50	2.70	3.50	4.20
<b>TYPE K COPPER – Please Quote Per Ft.</b>							
107	¾" – 60 FT. ROLL	3.80	No Bid	4.81	No Bid	3.55	4.95
108	¾" – 100 FT. ROLL	3.80	No Bid	4.81	No Bid	3.55	4.95

109	1" – 60 FT. ROLL	4.97	No Bid	5.89	No Bid	4.80	6.10
110	1" – 100 FT. ROLL	4.97	No Bid	5.89	No Bid	4.80	6.10
111	1-1/2" – 60 FT. ROLL	8.06	No Bid	9.87	No Bid	8.00	9.65
112	1-1/2" – 100 FT. ROLL	8.06	No Bid	9.87	No Bid	8.00	9.65
113	2" – 40 FT. ROLL	12.99	No Bid	15.89	No Bid	13.00	15.20
114	2" – 60 FT. ROLL	12.99	No Bid	15.89	No Bid	13.00	15.20
<b>SENSUS WATER METER - Any Meter in Production at Time of Quote</b>							
115	1.5" OMNI T2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
116	2" OMNI T2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
117	3" OMNI T2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
118	4" OMNI T2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
119	5/8" IPEARL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
120	3/4" IPEARL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
121	1" IPEARL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
122	1.5" OMNI C2 / R2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
123	2" OMNI C2 / R2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
124	3" OMNI T2 / C2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
125	4" OMNI T2 / C2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
126	6" OMNI T2 / C2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>FORD METER HORN &amp; VALVES</b>		No Lead		No Lead		No Lead	
127	¾" HORN	56.50	No Bid	53.00	No Bid	57.89	No Bid
128	1" HORN	85.30	No Bid	81.50	No Bid	86.22	No Bid
129	¾" BALL VALVE	8.10	No Bid	7.50	No Bid	8.20	No Bid
130	1" BALL VALVE	11.95	No Bid	10.25	No Bid	11.77	No Bid
<b>LARGE METER FLANGE KIT</b>						No Lead	
131	1-1/2" BRONZE FLANGE KIT	72.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	74.00	No Bid
132	2" BRONZE FLANGE KIT	99.53	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	102.00	No Bid
133	3" BRONZE FLANGE KIT	185.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	190.00	No Bid
134	4" BRONZE FLANGE KIT	296.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	303.00	No Bid
<b>FIRE HYDRANT METER</b>							
3" ABB HYDRANT METER							
135	W/INTERNAL CHECK VALVE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1,050.00	No Bid
<b>MISC.</b>							
136	SMART POINT METER READING UNITS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid