

Bid Tabulation
14-40
Chemicals for the City of Aurora Water Treatment Plant
Bid Opening October 22, 2014

		1	2	3	4	5
Company Name		Ammonia Ammonia	Liquid Ferric Chloride	Carbon Dioxide	Sodium Hypo- chlorite	Calcium Oxide (QuickLime)
Tanner Industries, Inc.	Year 1	0.705				
Tanner Industries, Inc.	Year 2	0.72				
Airgas USA, LLC	Year 1	0.82		0.054		
Airgas USA, LLC	Year 2	0.88		0.058		
Alexander Chemical Corporation	Year 1				0.69	
Alexander Chemical Corporation	Year 2				0.69	
Mississippi Lime Company	Year 1					172.06
Mississippi Lime Company	Year 2					181.35
PVS Technologies, Inc.	Year 1		0.0846			
PVS Technologies, Inc.	Year 2		0.0846			
Graymont Western Lime, Inc.	Year 1					166.00
Graymont Western Lime, Inc.	Year 2					172.00
Kemira Water Solutions Inc	Year 1		0.086			
Kemira Water Solutions Inc	Year 2		0.091			
Continental Carbonic Products, Inc.	Year 1			0.0545		
Continental Carbonic Products, Inc.	Year 2			0.056		
Lhoist North America of Missouri, Inc.	Year 1					236.94
Lhoist North America of Missouri, Inc.	Year 2					No Bid
Praxair, Inc.	Year 1			No Bid		
Praxair, Inc.	Year 2			No Bid		
Vertex Chemical Corporation	Year 1				0.73	
Vertex Chemical Corporation	Year 2				No Bid	
Carmeuse Lime & Stone	Year 1					189.61
Carmeuse Lime & Stone	Year 2					195.30
Pencco, Inc	Year 1		No Bid			
Pencco, Inc	Year 2		No Bid			

Bid Tabulation
14-40
Chemicals for the City of Aurora Water Treatment Plant
Bid Opening October 22, 2014

Company Name		Ammonia Ammonia	Liquid Ferric Chloride	Carbon Dioxide	Sodium Hypo- chlorite	Calcium Oxide (QuickLime)
GEO Specialty Chemicals	Year 1	No Bid				
GEO Specialty Chemicals	Year 2	No Bid				
Rowell Chemical Corporation	Year 1				0.648	
Rowell Chemical Corporation	Year 2				No Bid	
Air Products and Chemicals, Inc.	Year 1			0.044		
Air Products and Chemicals, Inc.	Year 2			0.0506		
K A Steel Chemicals, Inc.	Year 1				0.63	
K A Steel Chemicals, Inc.	Year 2				0.70	