

City of Aurora Request for Quotations 15-56
2016 Materials and Supplies for Water and Sewer Maintenance Department
Bid Tabulation

Line Item	Description	HD						
		Ferguson Waterworks Dekalb, IL	Waterworks Carol Stream, IL	JSN Contractors Supply Naperville, IL	Mid American Water, Inc. Aurora, IL	Underground Pipe and Valve Co Plainfield, IL	Water Products Company Aurora, IL	Ziebell Water Service Products, Inc. Elk Grove Village, IL
HYDRANTS (WATEROUS)								
1	5' WB-67 (W/ACC)	No Bid	\$ 2,200.00	No Bid	\$ 2,140.00	No Bid	\$ 2,134.00	\$ 2,390.00
2	5'6" WB-67 (W/ACC)	No Bid	\$ 2,235.00	No Bid	\$ 2,189.00	No Bid	\$ 2,180.00	\$ 2,440.00
3	6' WB-67 (W/ACC)	No Bid	\$ 2,300.00	No Bid	\$ 2,236.00	No Bid	\$ 2,227.00	\$ 2,495.00
4	4 1/2' WB-67 (W/ACC)	No Bid	\$ 2,159.00	No Bid	\$ 2,095.00	No Bid	\$ 2,115.00	\$ 2,335.00
EXTENSIONS (WATEROUS ONLY)								
5	6" WB-67	No Bid	\$ 375.00	No Bid	\$ 349.00	No Bid	\$ 348.00	\$ 365.00
6	12" WB-67	No Bid	\$ 440.00	No Bid	\$ 410.00	No Bid	\$ 409.00	\$ 430.00
7	18" WB-67	No Bid	\$ 515.00	No Bid	\$ 470.00	No Bid	\$ 475.00	\$ 495.00
8	24" WB-67	No Bid	\$ 585.00	No Bid	\$ 537.00	No Bid	\$ 537.00	\$ 545.00
WB-67 TRAFFIC KITS (WATEROUS ONLY)								
9	OLD STYLE (K525/10")	No Bid	\$ 225.00	No Bid	\$ 197.00	No Bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 235.00
10	NEW STYLE (K528/10")	No Bid	\$ 185.00	No Bid	\$ 164.00	No Bid	\$ 184.00	\$ 210.00
MJ CUTTING IN VALVES (WITH ACC)								
FLOW RESILIENT WEDGE								
11	2"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	4"	\$ 632.67	\$ 975.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 708.00	\$ 855.00	No Bid
13	6"	\$ 760.40	\$ 1,310.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 967.00	\$ 1,165.00	No Bid
14	8"	\$ 1,132.75	\$ 2,015.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,473.00	\$ 1,805.00	No Bid
15	10"	\$ 1,786.41	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,072.00	\$ 2,672.00	No Bid
16	12"	\$ 2,091.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,725.00	\$ 3,370.00	No Bid

**MJ REGULAR VALVES (WITH ACC)
AMERICAN FLOW CONTROL RESILIENT WEDGE**

17 2"
18 4"
19 6"
20 8"
21 10"
22 12"
23 14"
24 16"

CUTTING IN SLEEVES (W/ACC) (TYLER ONLY)

25 4"
26 6"
27 8"
28 10"
29 12"

30 **664-S VALVE BOX COMPLETE W/LID (TYLER ONLY)**

VALVE BOX EXTENSIONS (TYLER ONLY)

31 #58
32 #59
33 #69
34 #69A – 9”
35 #69A – 18” (Foreign okay)
36 #69A – 24” (Foreign okay)

CAST COUPLINGS

37 2"
38 4"
39 6" All 6" & above quote the
40 8" the following brands:
41 12" Mid America - power steel
42 14" US Filter - smith/blair
43 16" Water Products - cascade

	No Bid	\$ 355.00	No Bid	\$ 342.00	\$ 358.00	No Bid	\$ 375.00	
	No Bid	\$ 540.00	No Bid	\$ 490.00	\$ 520.00	\$ 520.00	\$ 575.20	
	No Bid	\$ 705.00	No Bid	\$ 675.00	\$ 680.00	\$ 664.00	\$ 730.00	
	No Bid	\$ 1,080.00	No Bid	\$ 1,024.00	\$ 1,031.00	\$ 1,021.00	\$ 1,149.00	
	No Bid	\$ 1,660.00	No Bid	\$ 1,546.00	\$ 1,592.00	\$ 1,578.00	\$ 1,749.00	
	No Bid	\$ 2,088.00	No Bid	\$ 1,945.00	\$ 1,995.00	\$ 1,974.00	\$ 2,295.00	
	No Bid	\$ 5,275.00	No Bid	\$ 5,185.00	\$ 6,998.00	\$ 6,840.00	\$ 6,750.00	
	No Bid	\$ 5,475.00	No Bid	\$ 5,193.00	\$ 7,602.00	\$ 6,437.00	\$ 7,475.00	
	\$ 407.28	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 405.00	\$ 405.00	\$ 425.00	\$ 440.00	
	\$ 542.79	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 540.00	\$ 545.00	\$ 571.00	\$ 575.00	
	\$ 702.87	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 699.00	\$ 695.00	\$ 738.00	\$ 740.00	
	\$ 862.21	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 858.00	\$ 855.00	\$ 908.00	\$ 929.00	
	\$ 1,182.37	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,142.00	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 1,208.00	\$ 1,310.00	
	\$ 164.69	\$ 175.00	No Bid	\$ 153.69	\$ 155.00	\$ 172.00	\$ 212.00	
	\$ 47.65	\$ 47.00	No Bid	\$ 45.10	\$ 44.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 60.00	
	\$ 58.08	\$ 60.00	No Bid	\$ 55.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 62.00	
	\$ 48.40	\$ 49.00	No Bid	\$ 46.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 47.00	\$ 61.00	
	\$ 46.16	\$ 46.00	No Bid	\$ 44.00	\$ 43.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 61.00	
	\$ 49.68	\$ 38.00	No Bid	\$ 70.00	No bid	\$ 35.00	\$ 70.00	
	\$ 59.99	\$ 38.00	No Bid	\$ 75.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 75.00	
	\$ 20.00	\$ 28.00	No Bid	\$ 64.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 47.00	\$ 49.00	
	\$ 45.51	\$ 57.00	No Bid	\$ 99.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 97.00	\$ 87.00	
	\$ 61.12	\$ 73.00	No Bid	\$ 160.00	\$ 66.00	\$ 158.00	\$ 125.00	
	\$ 78.47	\$ 92.00	No Bid	\$ 190.00	\$ 89.00	\$ 199.00	\$ 160.00	
	\$ 158.89	\$ 156.00	No Bid	\$ 289.00	\$ 179.00	\$ 342.00	\$ 235.00	
	\$ 236.96	\$ 260.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 276.00	No Bid	\$ 439.00	
	\$ 312.78	\$ 346.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 366.00	No Bid	\$ 539.00	

WB-67 HYDRANT PARTS (WATEROUS ONLY)

44 K834 Complete w/top assembly
 45 K836
 46 Ref. #60 Casting (Hydrant Head)

	No Bid	\$ 1,875.00	No Bid	\$ 2,100.00	No Bid	\$ 2,130.00	\$ 2,400.00
	No Bid	\$ 1,015.00	No Bid	\$ 1,120.00	No Bid	\$ 1,152.00	\$ 1,300.00
	No Bid	\$ 410.00	No Bid	\$ 580.00	No Bid	\$ 440.00	\$ 580.00

47 **3/4" FLARED CORP (FORD-MCDONALD-MUELLER)**

\$ 21.50	\$ 25.00	No Bid	\$ 21.15	\$ 22.00	\$ 21.60	\$ 39.00
----------	----------	--------	----------	----------	----------	----------

48 **1" FLARED CORP (FORD-MCDONALD-MUELLER)**

\$ 32.86	\$ 38.00	No Bid	\$ 32.30	\$ 34.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 52.00
----------	----------	--------	----------	----------	----------	----------

49 **1-1/2" FLARED CORP**

\$ 100.21	\$ 112.00	No Bid	\$ 99.90	\$ 102.00	\$ 100.15	\$ 135.00
-----------	-----------	--------	----------	-----------	-----------	-----------

50 **2" FLARED CORP**

\$ 175.04	\$ 199.00	No Bid	\$ 174.00	\$ 177.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 235.00
-----------	-----------	--------	-----------	-----------	-----------	-----------

CURB STOP-FULL PORT (Curb stop -full port Flared) (Ford-McDonald-Mueller)

51 3/4"
 52 1"
 53 1-1/2"
 54 2"

\$ 51.43	\$ 68.00	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 51.40	\$ 59.00
\$ 69.41	\$ 92.00	No Bid	\$ 68.70	\$ 70.00	\$ 69.40	\$ 78.00
\$ 163.09	\$ 225.00	No Bid	\$ 162.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 163.00	\$ 215.00
\$ 263.86	\$ 360.00	No Bid	\$ 261.00	\$ 266.00	\$ 263.50	\$ 299.00

CURB BOXES – No Foreign Boxes

55 1-1/4" (5-6 FEET BURY)
 56 1-1/2" (5-6 FEET BURY)

\$ 27.96	\$ 32.50	No Bid	\$ 35.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 27.90	\$ 40.00
\$ 41.09	\$ 43.26	No Bid	\$ 46.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 41.05	\$ 48.50

MJ ACCESSORY KIT

57 SDR 21 - 2"
 58 4"
 59 6"
 60 8"
 61 10"
 62 12"

\$ 15.30	\$ 15.00	No Bid	\$ 24.00	\$ 19.00	No Bid	\$ 24.00
\$ 18.60	\$ 15.00	No Bid	\$ 25.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 29.02	\$ 26.00
\$ 22.08	\$ 20.00	No Bid	\$ 29.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 37.46	\$ 34.00
\$ 25.88	\$ 22.00	No Bid	\$ 35.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 40.50	\$ 38.00
\$ 35.80	\$ 30.00	No Bid	\$ 45.00	\$ 67.00	\$ 55.75	\$ 49.00
\$ 39.00	\$ 34.00	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 58.05	\$ 53.00

DR-18 C-900 PVC PIPE 20'

63 4"
 64 6"
 65 8"
 66 10"
 67 12"
 68 16"
 69 18"

\$ 45.60	\$ 2.07	No Bid	2.22 per foot	2.06 per foot	2.15 per foot	\$ 70.00
\$ 90.60	\$ 4.10	No Bid	4.38 per foot	4.06 per foot	4.25 per foot	\$ 130.00
\$ 156.80	\$ 6.96	No Bid	7.61 per foot	7.04per foot	7.35 per foot	\$ 190.00
\$ 235.40	\$ 10.60	No Bid	11.43 per foot	10.55 per foot	11.01 per foot	\$ 300.00
\$ 358.20	\$ 14.96	No Bid	16.12 per foot	14.89 per foot	15.55 per foot	\$ 400.00
\$ 674.80	\$ 26.00	No Bid	28.73 per foot	26.70 per foot	29.74 per foot	\$ 800.00
\$ 839.60	\$ 34.50	No Bid	36.16 per foot	33.64 per foot	37.50 per foot	\$ 1,000.00

106	BLUE PAINT/CAN	\$ 2.30	\$ 2.30	\$ 2.08	\$ 4.50	\$ 4.25	\$ 3.25	\$ 5.00
107	GREEN PAINT/CAN	\$ 2.30	\$ 2.30	\$ 2.08	\$ 4.50	\$ 4.25	\$ 3.25	\$ 5.00
108	WHITE PAINT/CAN	\$ 2.30	\$ 2.30	\$ 2.08	\$ 4.50	\$ 4.25	\$ 3.25	\$ 5.00
	TYPE K COPPER – Please Quote Per Ft.							
109	¾" – 60 FT. ROLL	\$ 2.97	\$ 3.41	No Bid	\$ 3.76	2.99 per foot	\$ 3.11	\$ 4.25
110	¾" – 100 FT. ROLL	\$ 2.97	\$ 3.41	No Bid	\$ 3.76	2.99 per foot	\$ 3.11	\$ 4.25
111	1" – 60 FT. ROLL	\$ 3.88	\$ 4.40	No Bid	\$ 4.90	3.90 per foot	\$ 4.05	\$ 5.50
112	1" – 100 FT. ROLL	\$ 3.88	\$ 4.40	No Bid	\$ 4.90	3.90 per foot	\$ 4.05	\$ 5.50
113	1-1/2" – 60 FT. ROLL	\$ 7.05	\$ 7.41	No Bid	\$ 8.18	6.60 per foot	\$ 6.77	\$ 8.50
114	1-1/2" – 100 FT. ROLL	\$ 7.05	\$ 7.41	No Bid	\$ 8.18	6.60 per foot	\$ 6.77	\$ 8.50
115	2" – 40 FT. ROLL	\$ 10.70	\$ 11.95	No Bid	\$ 13.19	10.60 per foot	\$ 10.90	\$ 13.75
116	2" – 60 FT. ROLL	\$ 10.70	\$ 11.95	No Bid	\$ 13.19	10.60 per foot	\$ 10.90	\$ 13.75
	FORD METER HORN & VALVES							
117	¾" HORN	\$ 56.66	\$ 56.50	No Bid	\$ 53.00	\$ 57.00	\$ 59.15	No Bid
118	1" HORN	\$ 85.30	\$ 88.00	No Bid	\$ 82.00	\$ 84.00	\$ 88.10	No Bid
119	¾" BALL VALVE	\$ 7.74	\$ 42.00	No Bid	\$ 7.70	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.15	No Bid
120	1" BALL VALVE	\$ 11.40	\$ 64.00	No Bid	\$ 11.40	\$ 11.75	\$ 12.00	No Bid
	LARGE METER FLANGE KIT							
121	1-1/2" BRONZE FLANGE KIT	\$ 71.91	\$ 58.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 71.00	\$ 74.00	No Bid
122	2" BRONZE FLANGE KIT	\$ 98.73	\$ 65.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 97.00	\$ 102.00	No Bid
123	3" BRONZE FLANGE KIT	\$ 183.65	\$ 215.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 180.00	\$ 190.00	No Bid
124	4" BRONZE FLANGE KIT	\$ 293.41	\$ 240.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 287.00	\$ 303.00	No Bid
	FIRE HYDRANT METER							
	3" HYDRANT METER							
125	W/INTERNAL CHECK VALVE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,125.00	No Bid