

City of Aurora Request for Quotations 16-16  
2016 Materials and Supplies for the Electrical Division  
Bid Tabulation

Line Item	Description	Crescent Electric Supply Co			
1	Stresscrete w/arm #E240-APH-G-S40-AG-C/W KA184H	\$	2,320.00		
2	Sternberg Model 39, 12', FP 4 – BCC – BK – DB – FCC.	\$	1,233.00		
3	Sternberg Washington BP17-12FG14		No Bid		
4	Millerbernd twin arm 40' 210B31-2 GV/PT/HA8-400-2-001-GV/PT	\$	2,813.00		
5	Millerbernd single arm 40'210B31-1 GV/PT/HA8-400-001-GV/PT	\$	2,528.00		
6	Milerbernd single arm 30'	\$	2,338.00		
7	Millerbernd single arm 24'	\$	1,843.00		
	<b>LIGHT FIXTURES &amp; BALLASTS</b>				
		<b>Leotek</b>	<b>American</b>		
8	LED cobra head (equivalent to 150w) with 7 wire photocell receptacle	\$	269.00	\$	187.00
9	LED cobra head (equivalent to 250w) with 7 wire photocell receptacle	\$	319.00	\$	204.00
10	LED cobra head (equivalent to 310w) with 7 wire photocell receptacle	\$	402.00	\$	269.00
11	LED cobra head (equivalent to 400w) with 7 wire photocell receptacle	\$	402.00	\$	303.00
12	LED cobra head Leotek GC-1-40F-MV-NW-3-GY-1A-RPB-PCR7	\$	374.00	\$	298.00
13	LED acorn Sentry SWW-50LEDV29-1.4A-840-BRT2-BPC120V-BK		No Bid		
14	LED acorn Sentry SMAS-32LEDV18-1.05A-840-STLA-BPC120V-BK		No Bid		
15	Sentry SCP-OB-100-120V-TYPEIII		No Bid		
16	GE Patriarch ballast PTRX15S1J1NBLCK002		No Bid		
17	GE Americana ballast AM8X17MOA2NBLCK		No Bid		
18	Matech Lighting Systems D4 LED post top retrofit		No Bid		
	<b>REPLACEMENT GLOBES</b>				
19	Decralite 88230ALEX5-9F-PL		No Bid		
20	Decralite FP518-1-8		No Bid		

	<b>LIGHT POLE BASES (BREAKAWAYS)</b>		
21	Component Products TB-6-9 with hardware	\$	298.00
22	Component products TB-5-9 with hardware	\$	298.00
23	Pole Safe PM4100 Breakaway anchor sets		No Bid
	<b>LAMPS</b>		
24	LU50MED GE or equal	\$	10.71
25	LU70MED GE or equal	\$	10.00
26	LU100MED GE or equal	\$	9.00
27	LU150MED GE or equal	\$	9.00
28	LU100 GE or equal	\$	8.41
29	LU150/55 GE or equal	\$	8.41
30	LU250 GE or equal	\$	8.41
31	LU310 GE or equal	\$	11.26
32	LU400 GE or equal	\$	8.41
33	LU1000 GE or equal	\$	33.72
34	MVR50/U GE or equal	\$	20.46
35	MVR70/U GE or equal	\$	17.65
36	MVR100/U GE or equal	\$	17.65
37	MVR150/U GE or equal	\$	17.65
38	MVR175/U GE or equal	\$	11.77
39	MVR250/U GE or equal	\$	11.77
40	MVR/400/U GE or equal	\$	12.18
41	MVR1000/U GE or equal	\$	23.53
	<b>FUSES AND ACCESSORIES</b>		
42	MOL 5 THRU 30 OR EQUAL		see attached
43	HEB AA FUSE HOLDER	\$	4.11
44	HEB AB FUSE HOLDER	\$	5.07
45	2A0660 INSULATED BOOT	\$	1.04
46	FRN R 5 THRU 100 OR EQUAL		see attached
47	FRS R 5 THRU 100 OR EQUAL		see attached

	<b>SPLICING</b>		
48	T&B YS8C CRIMP SLEEVE	\$	1.49

49	T&B YS6C “	\$	2.97
50	T&B YS4C “	\$	3.60
51	T&B YS2C “	\$	4.38
52	T&B HS16-12-L SHRINK TUBE	\$	4.77
53	T&B HS12-6-L “	\$	4.93
54	T&B HS6-1-L “	\$	5.50
55	T&B HSC2-20 SHRINK CAP	\$	6.18