
  May 16, 2014 
 

P:\Bldg&Permits\Electrical Commission\2014 adoption of the 2011\Proposed 2014 - Aurora Electrical code-Chapter 12 - IEBC.docx 1 of 3 

CHAPTER 12 BUILDINGS AND 
BUILDING REGULATIONS* 

INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE  
 
*Cross reference(s)--Airport zoning, § 5-36 et seq.; erosion and sedimentation control, Ch. 15; fire 
prevention codes and standards, § 17-101 et seq.; floodplain management, Ch. 18; open housing, § 22-

41 et seq.; planning and development, Ch. 34; preservation, Ch. 37; awnings, § 42-176 et seq.; subdivisions, Ch. 43; zoning, App. A. --State 
law reference(s)--Powers of home rule units, Ill. Const. art. VII, § 6. 

ARTICLE II.  BUILDING CODES* 
ELECTRICAL PROVISIONS OF THE  

INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE  
 

Currently adopted 2009 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE is amended per below. 
 

 

LEVEL 00 - REPAIR 
CHAPTER 05  LEVEL 00- REPAIRS 
REPAIR. The restoration to good or sound condition of any part of an existing building for the purpose of its maintenance.  
 
SECTION 501 GENERAL 
501.1 Scope. Repairs as described in Section 402 shall comply with the requirements of this chapter. Repairs to historic 

buildings need only comply with Chapter 11.  
[B] HISTORIC BUILDING. Any building or structure that is listed in the State or National Register of Historic Places; designated 
as a historic property under local or state designation law or survey; certified as a contributing resource within a National Register 
listed or locally designated historic district; or with an opinion or certification that the property is eligible to be listed on the National 
or State Register of Historic Places either individually or as a contributing building to a historic district by the State Historic 
Preservation Officer or the Keeper of the National Register of Historic Places. 

 
SECTION 507 ELECTRICAL 
507.1 Material. Existing electrical wiring and equipment undergoing repair shall be allowed to be repaired or replaced with 

like material. 
 

507.1.1 Receptacles. Replacement of electrical receptacles shall comply with the applicable requirements of Section 
406.3(D) of NFPA 70. 

 
507.1.2 Plug fuses. Plug fuses of the Edison-base type shall be used for replacements only where there is no evidence of 

over fusing or tampering per applicable requirements of Section 240.51(B) of NFPA 70. 
 
507.1.3 Nongrounding-type receptacles. For replacement of nongrounding-type receptacles with grounding type 

receptacles and for branch circuits that do not have an equipment grounding conductor in the branch circuitry, 
the grounding conductor of a grounding-type receptacle outlet shall be permitted to be grounded to any 
accessible point on the grounding electrode system or to any accessible point on the grounding electrode 
conductor in accordance with Section 250.130(C) of NFPA 70. 

 
507.1.4 Group I-2 receptacles. Non-“hospital grade” receptacles in patient bed locations of Group I-2 shall be replaced 

with “hospital grade” receptacles, as required by NFPA 99 and Article 517 of NFPA 70. 
 
507.1.5 Grounding of appliances. Frames of electric ranges, wall-mounted ovens, counter-mounted cooking units, 

clothes dryers and outlet or junction boxes that are part of the existing branch circuit for these appliances shall 
be permitted to be grounded to the grounded circuit conductor in accordance with Section 250.140 of NFPA 70. 

 

 



  May 16, 2014 
 

P:\Bldg&Permits\Electrical Commission\2014 adoption of the 2011\Proposed 2014 - Aurora Electrical code-Chapter 12 - IEBC.docx 2 of 3 

ALTERATION LEVEL 01 – RENOVATION 
CHAPTER 06    ALTERATION LEVEL 01 – RENOVATION 
 
Level 1 Alteration/Renovation. Include the removal and replacement of the covering of existing materials, elements, 

equipment, or fixtures using new materials, elements, equipment, or fixtures that serve the same purpose.  
 
SECTION 607 ENERGY CONSERVATION 
607.1 Minimum requirements. Level 1 alterations to existing buildings or structures are permitted without requiring the 

entire building or structure to comply with the energy requirements of the International Energy Conservation Code or 
International Residential Code. The alterations shall conform to the energy requirements of the International Energy 
Conservation Code or International Residential Code as they relate to new construction only. 

 

ALTERATION LEVEL 02 – 
ALTERATION / RECONFIGURATION 

 
CHAPTER 07    ALTERATION LEVEL 02 -- ALTERATION / RECONFIGURATION 
Level 2 Alteration/Reconfiguration, include the reconfiguration of space, the addition or elimination of any door or 

window, the reconfiguration or extension of any system, or the installation of any additional equipment.   
 
SECTION 708 ENERGY CONSERVATION 
708.1 New installations. All newly installed electrical equipment and wiring relating to work done in any work area shall 

comply with the materials and methods requirements of Chapter 7. 
Exception: Electrical equipment and wiring in newly installed partitions and ceilings shall comply with all applicable 

requirements of NFPA 70. 
 
708.2 Existing installations. Existing wiring in all work areas in Group A-1, A-2, A-5, H and I occupancies shall be upgraded 

to meet the materials and methods requirements of Chapter 7. 
 
708.3 Residential occupancies. In Group R-2, R-3 and R-4 occupancies and buildings regulated by the International 

Residential Code, the requirements of Sections 808.3.1 through 808.3.7 shall be applicable only to work areas located 
within a dwelling unit. 
708.3.1 Enclosed areas. All enclosed areas, other than closets, kitchens, basements, garages, hallways, laundry areas, 

utility areas, storage areas and bathrooms shall have a minimum of two duplex receptacle outlets or one duplex 
receptacle outlet and one ceiling or wall-type lighting outlet. 

708.3.2 Kitchens. Kitchen areas shall have a minimum of two duplex receptacle outlets. 
708.3.3 Laundry areas. Laundry areas shall have a minimum of one duplex receptacle outlet located near the laundry 

equipment and installed on an independent circuit. 
708.3.4 Ground fault circuit interruption. Newly installed receptacle outlets shall be provided with ground fault circuit 

interruption as required by NFPA 70. 
708.3.5 Minimum lighting outlets. At least one lighting outlet shall be provided in every bathroom, hallway, stairway, 

attached garage, and detached garage with electric power, and to illuminate outdoor entrances and exits. 
708.3.6 Utility rooms and basements. At least one lighting outlet shall be provided in utility rooms and basements 

where such spaces are used for storage or contain equipment requiring service. 
708.3.7 Clearance for equipment. Clearance for electrical service equipment shall be provided in accordance with the 

NFPA 70. 
 
SECTION 711 ENERGY CONSERVATION 
711.1 Minimum requirements. Level 2 alterations to existing buildings or structures are permitted without requiring the 

entire building or structure to comply with the energy requirements of the International Energy Conservation Code or 
International Residential Code. The alterations shall conform to the energy requirements of the International Energy 
Conservation Code or International Residential Code as they relate to new construction only. 

 

 



  May 16, 2014 
 

P:\Bldg&Permits\Electrical Commission\2014 adoption of the 2011\Proposed 2014 - Aurora Electrical code-Chapter 12 - IEBC.docx 3 of 3 

ALTERATIONS LEVEL 03 – 
RECONSTRUCTION / EXTENSIVE ALTERATION 

 
CHAPTER 08   ALTERATIONS LEVEL 03 - RECONSTRUCTION / EXTENSIVE ALTERATION 
Level 3 Alteration / Reconfiguration, apply where the work area exceeds 50 percent of the aggregate area of the building.  
 
SECTION 808 ENERGY CONSERVATION 
808.1 Minimum requirements. Level 3 alterations to existing buildings or structures are permitted without requiring the 

entire building or structure to comply with the energy requirements of the International Energy Conservation Code or 
International Residential Code. The alterations shall conform to the energy requirements of the International Energy 
Conservation Code or International Residential Code as they relate to new construction only. 

 

CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY 
 
CHAPTER 09    CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY 
SECTION 908 ELECTRICAL 
908.1 Special occupancies. Where the occupancy of an existing building or part of an existing building is changed to one of 

the following special occupancies as described in NFPA 70, the electrical wiring and equipment of the building or portion 
thereof that contains the proposed occupancy shall comply with the applicable requirements of NFPA 70 whether or not a 
change of occupancy group is involved: 

1.  Hazardous locations. 
2.  Commercial garages, repair, and storage. 
3.  Aircraft hangars. 
4.  Gasoline dispensing and service stations. 
5.  Bulk storage plants. 
6.  Spray application, dipping, and coating processes. 
7.  Health care facilities. 
8.  Places of assembly. 
9.  Theaters, audience areas of motion picture and television studios, and similar locations. 
10.  Motion picture and television studios and similar locations. 
11.  Motion picture projectors. 
12.  Agricultural buildings. 

908.2 Unsafe conditions. Where the occupancy of an existing building or part of an existing building is changed, all unsafe 
conditions shall be corrected without requiring that all parts of the electrical system comply with NFPA 70. 

908.3 Service upgrade. Where the occupancy of an existing building or part of an existing building is changed, electrical 
service shall be upgraded to meet the requirements of NFPA70 for the new occupancy. 

908.4 Number of electrical outlets. Where the occupancy of an existing building or part of an existing building is changed, the 
number of electrical outlets shall comply with NFPA 70 for the new occupancy. 

 
ADDITIONS 

 
CHAPTER 10    ADDITIONS 
SECTION 1006 ENERGY CONSERVATION 
1006.1 Minimum requirements. Additions to existing buildings shall conform to the energy requirements of the International 

Energy Conservation Code or International Residential Code as they relate to new construction. 
 
 
 
 


